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Natural disasters are not bound by political boundaries
and have no social or economic considerations. They

are borderless as they affect both developing and
developed countries, they are also merciless, and as such
the vulnerable tend to suffer more at the impact of natural
disasters. For example, the developing countries are much
more seriously affected in terms of the loss of lives,
hardship borne by population and the percentage of their
GNP lost. Since 1991, two-third of the victims of natural
disasters was from developing countries, while just 2 per
cent were from highly developed nations. Those living in
developing countries and especially those with limited
resources tend to be more adversely affected. With the
alarming rise in the natural disasters and vulnerability per
se, the world community is strengthening its efforts to
cope with it. India has been traditionally vulnerable to
natural disasters on account of its unique geo-climatic
conditions. Floods, droughts, cyclones, earthquakes and
landslides have been recurrent phenomena. About 60%
of the landmass is prone to earthquakes of various
intensities; over 40 million hectares is prone to floods;
about 8% of the total area is prone to cyclones and 68%
of the area is susceptible to drought. In the decade 1990-
2000, an average of about 4344 people lost their lives and
about 30 million people were affected by disasters every
year. The loss in terms of private, community and public
assets has been astronomical. The super cyclone in Orissa
in October, 1999 and the Bhuj earthquake in Gujarat in
January, 2001 underscored the need to adopt a multi
dimensional endeavour involving diverse scientific,
engineering, financial and social processes; the need to
adopt multi disciplinary and multi sectoral approach and
incorporation of risk reduction in the developmental plans
and strategies. Disaster management occupies an
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important place in this country’s policy framework as it is
the poor and the under-privileged who are worst affected
on account of calamities/disasters.

At the global level, there has been considerable
concern over natural disasters. Even as substantial
scientific and material progress is made, the loss of lives
and property due to disasters has not decreased. In fact,
the human toll and economic losses have mounted. It was
in this background that the United Nations General
Assembly, in 1989, declared the decade 1990-2000 as
the International Decade for Natural Disaster Reduction
with the objective to reduce loss of lives and property
and restrict socio-economic damage through concerted
international action, especially in developing countries.

Natural disasters are not bound by political
boundaries and have no social or economic
considerations. They are borderless as they affect both
developing and developed countries, they are also
merciless, and as such the vulnerable tend to suffer more
at the impact of natural disasters. For example, the
developing countries are much more seriously affected
in terms of the loss of lives, hardship borne by population
and the percentage of their GNP lost. Since 1991, two-
third of the victims of natural disasters was from
developing countries, while just 2 per cent were from
highly developed nations. Those living in developing
countries and especially those with limited resources tend
to be more adversely affected. With the alarming rise in
the natural disasters and vulnerability per se, the world
community is strengthening its efforts to cope with it.

India has been traditionally vulnerable to natural
disasters on account of its unique geo-climatic conditions.
Floods, droughts, cyclones, earthquakes and landslides
have been recurrent phenomena. About 60% of the
landmass is prone to earthquakes of various intensities;
over 40 million hectares is prone to floods; about 8% of
the total area is prone to cyclones and 68% of the area is
susceptible to drought. In the decade 1990-2000, an
average of about 4344 people lost their lives and about
30 million people were affected by disasters every year.
The loss in terms of private, community and public assets
has been astronomical.
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